

BID #08-SCH-82

AUDIO VISUAL EQUIPMENT/SUPPLIES & LIBRARY MATERIALS CATALOG DISCOUNT

Abolins awarded Item 1 (Toshiba 37HL67).

Audio Visual Innovations awarded Items 32, 33, 48 (Comprehensive MPRA-3PP-6B), 62.

BES Industries Inc awarded Items 1 (20"- 27"- 32" Sylvania CRT Tube Set), 2, 4, 8, 9, 10 (27" TV Cart Bretford BB44-M4 & 32"-35" TV Cart Bretford VTRRB44-M8), 12, 15 (Interlink VP6450), 16, 18 (Olympus FE210, Battery Pack, Neck Strap, Carry Case – *purchase camera and options together*), 25 (JVC SR-DVM600US & Casio CW-K85), 37, 39, 40, 45, 47, 48 (AGI Connections A353RCA03), 49 (Blonder Tongue AMCM-860 7766B), 53 (Anchor Liberty Basic – *purchase system only*), 56, 60, 61, 63, 64.

Best Buy Gov awarded Item 1 (Insignia NS-LCD37)

Camcor awarded Items 6, 17 (Qomo QD600), 24, 27.

Computrac Interactive Solutions awarded Item 17 (Qomo QD700).

Encore Broadcast awarded 25 (MicroBoard MLDV-1000), 31, 43, 44, 49 (Blonder Tongue AM-60-860), 50.

Lee Hartman (Marian Zimmerman) awarded Item 29.

School Specialty awarded Items 7, 10 (37"-40" TV Cart Bretford BBUL444-M).

Smileys Audio Visual awarded Items 3, 5, 11, 21, 22, 23, 51, 52, 54.

Southern Business Communications, Inc awarded Items 18 (Sony DSCH7/B & Battery Pack), 25 (Zenith DVB712), 28, 30, 41, 42, 57.

Troxell awarded Items 13, 14, 15 (Interlink VP4810), 18 (Olympus FE210 – *purchase camera only*), 19, 26, 34, 35, 38, 53 (Anchor LBP 600, LIB6001 Speakers, WH6000 Wir. Mic. – *purchase camera and options together*), 55, 59, 66.

United Data Technologies awarded Item 20.

16 Vendors: AFP Industries, Inc, Audio Visual Innovations, BES, Best Buy Gov, Computrac, Encore Broadcast, Highsmith, K & W, Lee Hartman (Marian Zimmerman), Library Store, Pyramid, School Specialty, Smileys AV, Southern Business, Troxell and United Data Technologies awarded **Product Line Catalog Discount.**

5 Vendors: BES, Gaylord Brothers, Highsmith, Library Store and Pyramid awarded **Library Materials Catalog Discount.**

Audio Visual Equipment/Supplies Library Materials Catalog Discount

Posted by: *Anna Dwyer*
 Witnessed by: *Richard White*
 Time/Date: *1:40 October 3 2007*

ITEM	DESCRIPTION	MODEL	PRICE	VENDOR
1	20" TELEVISION	Sylvania CRT Style Tube Set	179.03	BES Industries Inc
	27" TELEVISION	Sylvania CRT Style Tube Set	279.03	BES Industries Inc
	32" TELEVISION	Sylvania CRT Style Tube Set	359.03	BES Industries Inc
	37" TELEVISION	Insignia NS-LCD37 Toshiba 37HL67	755.00 994.45	Best Buy Gov, LLC Abolins
2	20" TV / DVD / VCR Combo	Magnavox MWC20T6	197.99	BES Industries Inc
3	Mobile Presenter	Numonics Corp. Mobile Presenter BTII	299.00	Smiley's Audio Visual
4	Wall Screen 70" x 70"	Bretford 6570 MKW6	49.98	BES Industries Inc
5	Trip. Screen 70" x 70"	Bretford 3770 MKE	75.00	Smiley's Audio Visual
6	Opaque Projector	Buhl Mark IV	806.99	Camcor, Inc
7	AV Projector Cart 34" - 5" Caster Pack	Bretford 34-ES 5" Caster Pack	80.07 34.92	School Specialty
8	Overhead Projector Cart	Bretford OH39E	97.43	BES Industries Inc
9	AV Projctr Cart 42" - 5" Caster PK - 3 outlet 20' Xcord	Bretford 42-E4 5" Caster Pack 3 Electrical Outlets	78.98 38.34 23.10	BES Industries Inc
10	27" TV Cart Widebody	Bretford BB44-M4 with 5" Caster Pack (two lock)	127.78	BES Industries Inc
	32 - 35" TV Cart Widebody	Bretford VTRRB44-M8	282.69	BES Industries Inc
	37 - 40" TV Cart Widebody	Bretford BBUL444-M5	262.40	School Specialty
11	TV Cart for 20"/smaller - 5" Caster Pack	Bretford MP48ES 5" Caster Pack	144.90 38.50	Smiley's Audio Visual
12	Notebook/Data Projector Cart - 5" Caster Pack	Bretford ECILS1-FF-BK 5" Caster Pack	181.39 38.34	BES Industries Inc
13	Multimedia Projector - Instal for Ceiling Mount - Replacement Lamp	Hitachi CPX200 (XGA 2200 Lumens) Installation for Ceiling Mount Hitachi CPX200 Lamp	612.24 100 an hr.+ mat 252.63	Troxell Communications, Inc
14	Multimedia Projector (caf) - Instal for Ceiling Mount - Replacement Lamp - Sound System	Hitachi CPX400 (XGA 3000 Lums networkable) Installation for Ceiling Mount Hitachi CPX400 Lamp Califonr PI20PS (price per each, need 2)	836.73 100 an hr.+ mat. 252.63 86.85	Troxell Communications, Inc
15	Mouse Presenter (wireless)	Interlink VP6450 Interlink VP4810	57.97 99.09	BES Industries Inc Troxell Communications, Inc

BID # 08-SCH-82
Audio Visual Equipment/Supplies Library Materials Catalog Discount

ITEM	DESCRIPTION	MODEL	PRICE	VENDOR
16	Portable Visual Presenter - Microscope Attachment	Avermedia AverVision 150 Microphone Attachment	394.97 45.97	BES Industries Inc
17	Stationery Visual Presenter	Qomo QD600 Qomo QD700	985.99 1006.5	Camcor, Inc Computrac Interactive Solutions
18	Digital Color Camera Still / low-end - Battery PK - Neck Strap - Carry Case (Middle Range Price)	Olympus FE210 (Purchase Camera Only) Olympus FE210 (Purchase pack w/ items below) Battery Pack Neck Strap Carry Case Sony DSC71B (Middle Price Range) Battery Pack	114.66 119.97 7.93 4.99 8.93 361.00 32.59	Troxell Communications, Inc BES Industries Inc BES Industries Inc BES Industries Inc BES Industries Inc Southern Business Communications, Inc Southern Business Communications, Inc
19	Digital Color Camera Still / high end - 18 to 55 mm Zoom Lens - Carry Case	Canon EOS 30D Body Kit Only/no Lens Incl. Canon 9475A002 Zoom Lens Vanguard PEKING25 Case	1149.26 145.75 23.80	Troxell Communications, Inc
20	Converter Computer to TV	AVerKey IIMicro	77.00	United Data Technologies
21	Overhead Projector	3M 1885	179.00	Smiley's Audio Visual
22	Overhead Projector low-end	3M 1711	90.00	Smiley's Audio Visual
23	Language Master	Califone 2010	125.00	Smiley's Audio Visual
24	DVD/VCR Combo	Zenith XBV713	67.59	Camcor, Inc
25	DVD Player	Zenith DVB712	45.23	Southern Business Communications, Inc
	DVD MiniDV Rec Combo	JVC SR-DVM600US	826.98	BES Industries Inc
	DVD Duplicator W/Lab	MicroBoard MLDV-1000	1,327.33	Encore Broadcast Equipment, Inc
	DVD CD Labeler	Casio CW-K85	69.97	BES Industries Inc
26	DV Motion Camera hig-end - Light - Replacement Battery PK - Shotgun Microphone	Canon GL2 Light Canon VL10LIII Replacement Battery Pack Canon BP930 Shotgun Microphone Canon DM50	2049.91 73.87 67.74 127.95	Troxell Communications, Inc
27	DV Motion Camera low-end - Camera Case - Replacement Battery PK	Canon ZR800 Camera Case Replacement Battery Pack	223.23 15.68 53.32	Camcor, Inc
28	Headphones	Califone 3068 AV	5.26	Southern Business Communications, Inc
29	Audio Mixer 6 Channel	Tapco Blend 6	89.00	Lee Hartman & Sons, Inc

Audio Visual Equipment/Supplies Library Materials Catalog Discount

BID # 08-SCH-82

ITEM	DESCRIPTION	MODEL	PRICE	VENDOR
30	Audio Mixer 16 Channel	Mackie 1604VLZ3	658.40	Southern Business Communications, Inc
31	Microphone VHF Wireless	Azden WMSPRO	144.50	Encore Broadcast Equipment, Inc
32	Microphone PZM hig-end	Crown PZM185	149.24	Audio Visual Innovations, Inc
33	Microphone PZM low-end	Crown Sound Grabber II	54.13	Audio Visual Innovations, Inc
34	Microphone Wireless System	Azden WXHPRO	153.60	Troxell Communications, Inc
35	Microphone Wireles Handheld *(VPH58 Discontinued by Most Vendors) *Troxell met Specs	Shure VPH58	315.57	Troxell Communications, Inc
36	Microphone Wireles Lavalier *(VPL93 Discontinued) *Replacements Different so NAS	Shure VPL93 *Discontinued	No Bid	No Bid - *Discontinued
37	Microphone Wire Handheld	Shure SM58 w/o Cable 25' Microphone Cable	80.67 13.93	BES Industries Inc
38	Microphone Wire Lavalier	Shure SM93	112.55	Troxell Communications, Inc
39	Microphone Short Shotgun	Audio Technica AT835B Audio Technica AT8035 (new model)	213.49 212.99	BES Industries Inc
40	Microphone Shotgun (DV Cam)	Azden SGM-X	96.93	BES Industries Inc
41	Microphone Stand	Atlas MS-12CE	27.64	Southern Business Communications, Inc
42	Microphone Stand Tabletop	Atlas DS-7E	15.77	Southern Business Communications, Inc
43	Cables 25' - with 3-pin XLR Connectors - Comparable to Anchor EX 25M	Shure C25J 25' extension cable w/ standard 3-pin XLR	13.22 13.22	Encore Broadcast Equipment, Inc
44	Cables 50" -w/ 3-pin XLR Conn. -to Anchor EX 50M	Shure C50J 50' extension cable w/ standard 3-pin XLR	15.25 15.25	Encore Broadcast Equipment, Inc
45	Cables Firwire 1394 6 to 4 pin - 6 Foot - 10 Foot - 25 Foot	FireWire IEEE 1394 6 to 4 pin Cables 6' 10' 25'	5.72 6.97 29.13	BES Industries Inc
46	Cables AV+ Audio Adapter	Cables w/ Audio Adapter	No Bid	No Bid
47	Cables VGA+ Connector Cbl	AGI Connections VHD15MM25	16.43	BES Industries Inc
48	Cables	AGI Connections A353RCA03 Comprehensive MPRA-3PP-6B	6.99 13.45	BES Industries Inc Audio Visual Innovations, Inc
49	Modulator	Blonder Tongue AMCM-860 7766B Blonder Tongue AM-60-860	258.19 927.96	BES Industries Inc Encore Broadcast Equipment, Inc

BID # 08-SCH-82
Audio Visual Equipment/Supplies Library Materials Catalog Discount

ITEM	DESCRIPTION	MODEL	PRICE	VENDOR
50	Agile Sub-Band Modulator	Blonder Tongue AM-60-550B/OPT4	616.03	Encore Broadcast Equipment, Inc
51	Boom Box low-end	Califone Spirit 1776	43.90	Smiley's Audio Visual
52	Boom Box hig-end	Califone 2395AV	83.32	Smiley's Audio Visual
53	Public Adres Syst Port. - Additional Speaker - Add'tl Wireles Microphon	Anchor Liberty Basic (Purchase System only) Anchor LBP 6000 (Purchase Pack, item below) Anchor LIB6001 Speakers Anchor WH6000 Wireless Microphone	1536.97 1547.34 246.27 236.69	BES Industries Inc Troxell Communications, Inc Troxell Communications, Inc Troxell Communications, Inc
54	Listening Center	Califone 1218AV-01	57.50	Smiley's Audio Visual
55	Cables Stero Dubbing - 12' - 25' - 50'	Cables Stero Dubbing (Alternate 10') Comprehensive 3RCA10ST Cable Comprehensive 3RCA 25T Cable Comprehensive 3RCA 50ST Cable	5.99 8.76 16.12	Troxell Communications, Inc
56	Cables Firwire Mal to Mal - 3' - 10'	FireWire (male to male) Cables	3.98 6.98	BES Industries Inc
57	5000 Lum. Multi Projector *(PLC-XP56 Discontinued) *Replace w/ PLC-XP57L	Sanyo PLC-XP57L	4,135.36	Southern Business Communications, Inc
58	5200 Lum. Multi Projector *(PLC-XF31N/NL Discontinued) *Replacements Different so NAS	PLC-XF31N/NL *Discontinued	No Bid	No Bid - *Discontinued
59	Screen 7.5' x 10'	Draper 104014	1,227.42	Troxell Communications, Inc
60	Tripod Heavy-duty - Wheels	David & Sanford CGCW2/F-12 Wheels	195.59 38.91	BES Industries Inc
61	Tripod Light-weight	David & Sanford/Tiffen Magnum XL Tripod	94.89	BES Industries Inc
62	Smart Board (active Whiteboard) - Mobile Floor Stand - Carrying Bag - Two 15 Watt Speakers	Smart SB680 FS670 floor stand CCJ-680 carrying bag SBA-NA two 15 watt speakers	1294.00 315.00 190.00 268.00	Audio Visual Innovations, Inc
63	Video Mixer Elem Level	Videonics MX-3000 MXPro Digital (MX-4)	1,641.41	BES Industries Inc
64	Video Mixer Jr & Sen Level	Videonics MX4DV	2,979.47	BES Industries Inc
65	Titlemaker *(MX3000 Discontinued) *Replacements Different so NAS	MX3000 *Discontinued	No Bid	No Bid - *Discontinued
66	Light Kit, Portable - To Go 95 Light Kit - Trans Light Kit	Lowel T110 - 1 light (no lamp/not a kit) Lowel GO95Z w/ GO85 Case Lowel T1923Z w/ LB-35 Soft Case	118.44 539.27 775.50	Troxell Communications, Inc